2017 UPSET SALE RESULTS

Sale was held on September 27, 2017 @ 9:00 A.M. in the basemet of the Blair County Court House

OPENING BID| WINNING BID PURCHASER
MAP/PARCEL NUMBER OWNER SITUS AMOUNT AMOUNT NAME & ADDRES
CITY OF ALTOONA

01.01-02..-182.00-000 ANTHONY BERTHA M 1109 17TH AVE 2,357.47 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.09-06..-148.00-000 BIANCONI LINDA R 2504 BEALE AVE 2,613.36 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE

BRYAN T & IDA A SMITH

1128 N 8TH AVENUE
01.13-35..-055.00-000 BOWERS ADAM D 409 N 17TH ST 954.59 954.59 |ALTOONA, PA 16601
01.07-11..-027.00-000 BUCHANAN ARCHIE C & SUSAN J 221 WALNUT AVE 2,201.99 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.05-09..-148.00-000 CAMPBELL FLORAJ 1828 14TH AVE 2,033.87 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE

VANESSA ANN ULRICH

103 LEXINGTON AVENUE
01.07-11..-188.00-000 CHERRY BARBARA C 101 LEXINGTON AVE 1,582.71 1,582.71 |ALTOONA, PA 16601
01.04-06..-121.00-000 CONRAD RENEE N 1407 3RD AVE 2,747.17 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.14-29..-033.00-000 COOLEY RANDALL D & JUDITH S 110 COLERIDGE AVE 5,634.77 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.05-10..-081.00-000 CUFF NORMAN L JR 1420 WASHINGTON AVE 4,125.03 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.09-08..-058.00-000 DAVIS NEIL A & PENNY L 1920 PINE AVE 2,309.83 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-04..-009.00-000 DEGENNARO JAMES T 2900 8TH AVE 4,146.67 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-04..-008.00-000 DEGENNARO JAMES T 2904 8TH AVE 2,749.08 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-13..-067.00-000 DEGENNARO JAMES T 2125 4TH AVE 3,512.87 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.07-11..-151.00-000 DENNY ROBERT L JR & FAY A 314 LEXINGTON AVE 957.02 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-09..-121.00-000 FEATHER DANIEL A & KELLY R 1800 6TH AVE 3,452.34 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.08-07..-105.00-000 FERRIER S FLORENCE 414 BELL AVE 3,628.64 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.02-04..-145.00-000 FETTER DOUGLAS C & AMY J 810 6TH AVE 813.71 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.08-02..-141.00-000 FINNEGAN JESSE J 419 6TH AVE 1,650.57 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.05-08..-033.00-000 GENA MICHAEL F ET AL 2214 16TH AVE 2,067.43 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.12-29..-032.00-000 GREEN CONSTANCE 947 CURTIS ST 440.62 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.01-02..-060.00-000 GROVE CHARLES R 1909 10TH ST 2,059.37 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.02-03..-180.00-000 HESS BETTY H 505 10TH ST 415.48 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.07-06..-024.00-000 HOOVER AMY E 324 SPRUCE AVE 2,904.90 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.14-13..-056.00-000 HORVATH DANIEL C 4015 5TH AVE 2,188.06 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.07-11..-226.00-000 ISRAEL JUDITH L 303 LEXINGTON AVE 675.33 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE

RICKY J KISSELL

1404 N 5TH AVENUE
01.13-34..-080.00-000 JOHNSTON HARRY L 1407 N 5TH AVE 2,104.39 2,104.39 |ALTOONA, PA 16601
01.05-10..-020.00-000 LEBERFINGER DAVID & CLAPPER GEORGE 1530 18TH ST 2,868.57 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-06..-131.00-000 M.R.S. FUNDING, LLC 2406 6TH AVE 921.98 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-06..-132.00-000 M.R.S. FUNDING, LLC 2404 6TH AVE 3,390.09 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE

RICH JONATHAN D (CURRENT OWNER

01.02-05..-191.00-000 MANNARINO DAVID R (PRIOR OWNER) 1009 2ND AVE 2,259.26 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.08-02..-160.00-000 MCCOY DONALD B SR 309 6TH AVE 3,150.06 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
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01.13-19..-027.00-000 MCINTIRE PATRICK F 612 N 10TH AVE 1,079.96 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.13-19..-028.00-000 MCINTIRE PATRICK F 616 N 10TH AVE 1,717.47 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.12-20..-017.00-000 MCNULTY KEVIN P 4001 BROAD AVE 8,931.50 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.05-17..-026.01-000 MERRIMAN PATTY LOU 1709 14TH AVE 732.23 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
CITY OF ALTOONA
1301 12TH ST., STE 100

01.13-27..-035.00-000 MIDNIGHT SUN ENTERPRISES 511 N 2ND ST 2,327.17 2,352.17 |ALTOONA, PA 16601

01.07-11..-083.00-000 MILLER JAMES F & MELODYLEE 114 HOWARD AVE 2,237.88 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.12-21..-011.00-000 MUSSER PATRICK D 3800 BROAD AVE 5,931.94 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.12-21..-010.00-000 MUSSER PATRICK D 3804 BROAD AVE 1,741.57 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.13-41..-042.00-000 MYERS MARY | 1318 N 4TH AVE 1,835.19 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.05-09..-028.00-000 MYERS TRAVIS S & JANET M 1920 15TH AVE 2,550.77 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.11-20..-064.00-000 OCKER PAUL S & TRACIE M 408 PINE AVE 938.62 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.04-06..-156.00-000 PATTERSON CHESTER R & THERESA 1524 2ND AVE 4,155.25 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.10-19..-017.00-000 PROGRESSIVE LANDSCAPES LLC 324 E BLAIR AVE 13,118.93 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.10-19..-012.00-000 PROGRESSIVE LANDSCAPES LLC 409 E PLEASANT VLY BLVD 8,744.61 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.10-01..-016.00-000 RHODES SALLY L & WAYNE 227 7TH AVE 1,050.26 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.04-07..-179.00-000 RODKEY MARGARET L 1214 2ND AVE 2,058.30 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.05-09..-149.00-000 SCHWARTZTRAUBER JOHN & BARBARA 1824 14TH AVE 1,222.37 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.03-05..-065.00-000 SCOTT JAMES J 1523 19TH AVE 4,038.34 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.02-06..-049.00-000 SEVERSON DONALD N & SUSAN 810 4TH AVE 1,767.86 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.13-28..-125.00-000 SHAW MELISSA R 329-31 N 5TH AVE 5,089.80 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.13-28..-162.00-000 SHAW MELISSA R & ROBERT A 326 N 5TH AVE 1,218.24 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.13-28..-163.00-000 SHAW MELISSA R & ROBERT A 405 N 4TH ST 723.72 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.04-06..-190.00-000 SIMANSKI CRAIG W 1403 2ND AVE 861.72 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-11..-064.00-000 SIMANSKI CRAIG W 1719 4TH AVE 758.13 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.01-03..-019.00-000 SIMANSKI CRAIG W 1123 16TH AVE 1,017.16 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.02-07..-027.00-000 SIMANSKI CRAIG W 407 7TH ST 3,415.63 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.09-08..-092.00-000 SIMANSKI CRAIG W 1911 W CHESTNUT AVE 3,844.31 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.11-19..-131.00-000 STEWART THOMAS A 1904 10TH ST 268.77 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.09-08..-056.00-000 SUMMERS MICHAEL T & TRACY A 1924 PINE AVE 2,183.72 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.01-02..-127.00-000 VINCENT JAMES H 1711 11TH ST 2,034.86 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.13-18..-152.00-000 VIPOND RONALD S 515N 7TH AVE 3,920.47 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.08-05..-019.00-000 WEAVER MATTHEW R & DIEHL JESSICA 326 4TH AVE 2,252.97 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-08..-065.00-000 WESTBERRY MARK S & LAVALLEE COREY D 2117 8TH AVE 1,502.26 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.05-02..-012.00-000 WEYER JEFFREY S & PAMELA S 2401 16TH ST 2,705.03 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.12-29..-033.00-000 WILT EDWARD 949 CURTIS ST 381.83 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.11-20..-006.00-000 YOUNG LOIS M & HOOVER CARL D 314 21ST AVE 3,648.14 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
01.06-12..-033.00-000 ZAJDER-RUPERT DIANE M 1910 4TH AVE 1,883.04 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE

ALLEGHENY TOWNSHIP

02.00-09..-021.05-051 BAKER KIM 110 MONARCH DR 1,703.80 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
02.00-13E.-047.00-000 GLUNT JAN SHORT ST 326.71 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
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ANTIS TOWNSHIP

03.00-21..-038.05-000 KOEHLE THOMAS A & JANETTE R E PLEASANT VALLEY BLVD 8,139.32 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
03.00-23C.-094.00-000 WAGNER JOHN H & ALICE E 2447 OLD 6TH AVE RD 546.24 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
BLAIR TOWNSHIP
04.00-07..-082.00-307 | HALL NATHAN | 460 GREENDOWN ACRES LN | 1,904.25 | NO BID |GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
DUNCANSVILLE BOROUGH
07.00-02..-029.00-000 | RICHARDSON JEAN H | 1105 3RD AVE | 802.68 | NO BID |GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
FRANKSTOWN TOWNSHIP
08.00-15B.-059.00-000 BHANDARI NAVDEEP ARDMORE DR 366.50 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
08.00-15B.-034.00-000 BHANDARI NAVDEEP PROUGH RD 366.50 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
08.00-02B.-011.00-000 COHEN ARTHUR S & DONNA S 607 WAVERLY DR 7,880.29 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
FREEDOM TOWNSHIP
09.00-06..-008.13-004 CLARK ROBERT DAVID 125 CHEVROLET DR 2,765.69 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
09.00-11..-026.02-000 SMITH THERESA L DUNNINGS HWY 891.59 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
GREENFIELD TOWNSHIP
ASSET LEQUIDATION GROUP OF PA LLC
6000 6TH AVENUE
10.00-07AC-106.00-000 BASYE JAMES M & KELLY A CHIMNEY WAY 491.82 491.82 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
ASSET LEQUIDATION GROUP OF PA LLC
6000 6TH AVENUE
10.00-07AB-041.00-000 COYLE RUTH F TIMBERMAN RD 708.07 708.07 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
10.00-07AE-001.00-000 DODSON KENNETH D 1138 POND ST 466.35 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
JORDAN C OLDHAM
PO BOX 385
10.00-09..-002.00-000 FULTZ GARY W 2197 RIGHT HAND GAP RD 3,403.68 3,403.68 |CLAYSBURG, PA 16625
ASSET LEQUIDATION GROUP OF PA LLC
6000 6TH AVENUE
10.00-07AD-186.00-000 GROVE PATRICK C SOUTH FORK RUN 313.22 313.22 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
KEVIN R WEYANDT
451 LEFT HAND GAP RD
10.00-09..-020.01-000 MARKOVICH JEFFREY 1931 SKI GAP RD 2,719.54 2,719.54 |CLAYSBURG, PA 16625
10.00-07AC-087.00-000 MCCRAKEN GORDON JR 8221 INGOT RD 6,413.23 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
ASSET LEQUIDATION GROUP OF PA LLC
6000 6TH AVENUE
10.00-07AE-088.00-000 MEALS SAMUEL D & ASHCRAFT CY POPLAR RUN RD 795.66 795.66 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
ASSET LEQUIDATION GROUP OF PA LLC
6000 6TH AVENUE
10.00-07AE-089.00-000 MEALS SAMUEL D & ASHCRAFT CY POPLAR RUN RD 772.40 772.40 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
10.00-07AE-080.00-000 PFEFFER HARRY & ROSELLA POPLAR RUN RD 586.41 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
10.00-12..-005.01-000 TIPTON HAROLD S & MARJORIE L 561 TIPPY HILL RD 8,175.98 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
10.00-14..-022.10-000 ZETH ROBERT E 249 SHOWALTER RD 4,942.12 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
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HOLLIDAYSBURG BOROUGH

MATTHEW J & HEATHER L CRUSINBERRY
150 WOODLAWN TER

11.04-03..-030.00-000 LEBERFINGER MARK D 522 CLARK ST 5,340.25 9,000.00 |[HOLLIDAYSBURG, PA 16648
JUNIATA TOWNSHIP
13.00-12..-007.00-002 DEMSKI SANDRA 2631 PARK DR 397.20 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
13.00-11..-012.00-030 MCCLELLAN MELISSA 118 CHEST DR 1,798.13 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
13.00-11..-012.00-024 RINGLER MATHEW 116 GROVE DR 503.28 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
LOGAN TOWNSHIP
SHANNON L & BRIAN P WARBURTON
612 YALE LANE
14.00-22B2-021.00-000 DEARMITT ROBERT W & KAREN K 610 YALE LN 499.03 499.03 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
14.00-22..-043.00-028 HOLLEN GABE 416 RHETT LN 1,296.49 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-11C.-028.00-000 ICKES SAMUEL P & NAOMI S 11TH AVE 523.19 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-11C.-030.00-000 ICKES SAMUEL P & NAOMI R S 11TH AVE 456.92 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-11C.-022.00-000 ICKES SAMUEL P & NAOMI R S 11TH AVE 626.28 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-11C.-029.00-000 ICKES SAMUEL P & NAOMI R S 11TH AVE 451.91 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-15AH-062.00-000 KELLEY HARRY EDWARD & DANIEL E BAYNTON AVE 1,807.45 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-23..-006.28-046 KORMAN JUDITH 415 KATHERINE RD 416.51 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
MUHAMMAD H SHAHID
1672 E PLEASANT VALLEY BLVD
14.00-22A2-009.00-003 LENNING SHAWN OR STACY RODKEY 126 LOCK HAVEN LN 506.36 506.36 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
14.00-23..-006.28-042 MAUK TERRY 516 MARGARET RD 758.32 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-22..-002.00-026 MAZUR RUTH & BOYLES FRANKLIN 202 ETEMPLE LN 594.28 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-15A1-043.00-000 MCDONALD CATHERINE V 113 PARRISH ST 5,731.36 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-22..-002.00-072 MYERS JEFF & TINA 115 TULANE LN 829.16 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
KENNETH A KNISELY
1821 FRANKSTOWN RD
14.00-15AV-012.00-000 RINGLER MARGARET D 318 FRANKSTOWN RD 6,821.05 6,821.05 |HOLLIDAYSBURG, PA 16648
14.00-18C.-203.01-000 RUGGERY VICTOR M 507 MOSSIDE CIR 3,657.32 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-23..-009.00-051 SIPE JESSICA DAWN 101 CLAIRMONT DR 1,348.44 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-22..-043.00-010 SNYDER FRED 306 SCARLET LN 1,707.63 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-18G.-040.00-000 WILINSKI JOHN J & SALLY 504 SYCAMORE ST 2,512.15 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
14.00-23..-005.01-003 WOMBACHER TIMOTHY 579 SANDY RUN RD 677.79 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
NORTH WOODBURY TOWNSHIP
TODD R & CAROL J REPLOGLE
143 ORE HOLE ROAD
17.00-09A.-005.00-000 BOWMAN BARBARA R 308 RED ROW LN 2,984.33 2,984.33 |MARTINSBURG, PA 16662
TODD R & CAROL J REPLOGLE
143 ORE HOLE ROAD
17.00-09A.-037.01-000 BOWMAN BARBARA R RED ROW LN 1,070.95 1,070.95 |[MARTINSBURG, PA 16662
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17.00-04..-011.00-149 | ROSS TOM 153 MARIAN AVE 3,359.07 | NO BID |GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
ROARING SPRING BOROUGH
18.00-01..-133.00-000 | CLAYBAUGH THOMAS D & GAIL L 320 POPLAR ST 6,748.88 | NO BID |GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
SNYDER TOWNSHIP
19.00-07..-009.02-001 FRIDAY JENNIFER 835 VANSCOYOC HOLLOW RD 3,105.43 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
19.00-09..-051.00-042 GARDNER-HAMPTON ARLENE M 145 GLADYS LN 1,240.69 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
TAYLOR TOWNSHIP
20.00-07A.-025.00-000 KEITH THOMAS L 1101 FRANKLIN ST 8,591.75 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
TYRONE BOROUGH
VINCENT MCCRACKEN
3808 5TH AVENUE
22.02-07..-078.00-000 MECKES DANIEL F 752 PARK AVE 8,377.46 8,377.46 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
VINCENT MCCRACKEN
3808 5TH AVENUE
22.02-07..-077.00-000 MECKES DANIEL F PARK AVE 699.87 699.87 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
VINCENT MCCRACKEN
3808 5TH AVENUE
22.02-07..-079.00-000 MECKES DANIEL F PARK AVE 640.98 640.98 |ALTOONA, PA 16602
22.04-08..-001.00-000 PLUEBELL ADAM J 1400 BALD EAGE AVE 2,163.48 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
22.04-09..-033.00-000 TATE EMMA L 1465 BLAIR AVE 3,972.03 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
JAMES | & GALE E BURKET
1548 DECKER HOLLOW RD
22.05-07..-060.00-000 ZIMMERMAN TRENT & RHONDA A 1653 COLUMBIA AVE 2,751.28 2,751.28 |TYRONE, PA 16686
WILLIAMSBURG BOROUGH
23.00-01..-012.06-000 LLOYD DAVID A & BETTY M 5 PINE ACRES 552.87 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
CORDELL CONSTRUCTION LLC
323 LARKE RD
23.00-04..-018.00-000 STEINBRUNNER BROCK 410 W 2ND ST 15,564.80 15,589.80 |WILLIAMSBURG, PA 16693
WOODBURY TOWNSHIP
DALE F & TRACI E MCCALL
314 MOUNTAIN VIEW DR
24.00-11..-028.00-000 DETWILER HARVEY E & PATRICIA 219 POND DR 1,925.29 1,950.29 |WILLIAMSBURG, PA 16693
24.00-04..-017.00-000 TOTH ALFRED L & MARIAN D COVERDALE RD 1,260.65 NO BID GOING TO THE 2018 JUDICIAL SALE
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