
 2019 UPSET SALE RESULTS
Sale was held on September 25, 2019 @ 9:00 A.M. in the basement of the Blair County Courthouse

CONTROL NO. OWNER SITUS MAP/PARCEL NUMBER
 OPENING BID 

AMOUNT 
 WINNING BID 

AMOUNT 
PURCHASER

NAME & ADDRESS

02092700 ALTOONA RESTAURANT GROUP LLC 3822-30 5TH AVE 01.14-27..-038.00-000 8,750.78         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02087450 ANTHONY SARAH M 1806 5TH AVE 01.06-09..-167.00-000 2,640.82         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

03365430 ARROYO JASON W 113 W 11TH AVE 01.13-09..-107.00-000 3,179.37         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

03335490 AUKER WAYNE T & AMANDA D 1716 N 7TH AVE 01.13-35..-017.00-000 5,188.25         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02189510 BARBIN PAMELA A 2008-10 15TH AVE 01.05-08..-086.00-000 4,270.45         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02012540 BARLEY JOSEPH W 511 1ST AVE 01.08-06..-024.00-000 2,903.35         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02074130 BEEGLE HEATHER S 905 4TH AVE 01.02-06..-068.00-000 2,176.66         2,176.66          
ANTHONY ERNST
408 7TH STREET
ALTOONA, PA 16602

04175320 BENDEN MARTHA L 2520-22 MAPLE AVE 01.09-03..-107.00-000 665.53            665.53             
CITY OF ALTOONA
1301 12TH ST., STE 104
ALTOONA, PA 16601

02075060 BLACK DOG PROPERTIES LLC 1201 4TH AVE 01.04-07..-061.00-000 608.69            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02120630 BONANNO JOHN 127 6TH AVE 01.10-01..-096.00-000 2,134.50         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04194400 BOWMAN KENSIL W JR 3118-20 OAK AVE 01.12-29..-039.00-000 1,281.28         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02052110 CARACCIOLO MATTHEW A 911 3RD AVE 01.02-06..-126.00-000 2,681.66         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04058648 CESSNA RICHARD W & SHARON F & CESSNA RICHARD W JR 300-02 BYRON AVE 01.14-41..-099.00-000 6,555.53         25,000.00       
HPD FLIP 2019, LP
720 FAYETTE ST
CONSHOHOCKEN, PA 19428

02039690 CESSNA RICHARD W JR 3RD AVE 01.08-03..-038.00-000 557.19            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01351870 DAUGHENBAUGH THOMAS E 540-42 49TH ST 01.14-10..-034.00-000 1,364.69         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01351900 DAUGHENBAUGH THOMAS E 544-46 49TH ST 01.14-10..-033.00-000 532.17            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04092100 EWIG THOMAS P & EWIG ALICE A 1625-33 CRAWFORD AVE 01.06-29..-038.00-000 3,554.58         3,554.58          
SENECA LEANDRO VIEW LLC
530 LYTTON AVE., 2ND FLR
PALO ALTO, CA 94301

02255840 FOUSE MILLIE J & RICHARD D 217-219 E 26TH AVE 01.11-11..-038.00-000 4,761.67         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02123480 FRANTZ TONYA L 1001 6TH AVE 01.02-03..-155.00-000 1,694.64         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01345840 GREEN WILLIAM J III & BONSELL REBECCA L 911 30TH ST 01.12-30..-042.00-000 4,561.17         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01304140 HALFPENNY DONALD L 2011 11TH ST 01.01-01..-015.00-000 6,198.76         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

CITY OF ALTOONA

          Last Updated on 10/3/2019 at 1:28 PM

THE PROPERTIES IN BOLD PRINT
ARE OVERBIDS AND THE MONIES WILL BE DISTRIBUTED

AFTER COURT APPROVAL IN APRIL OF 2020 Pg 1 of 10        



 2019 UPSET SALE RESULTS
Sale was held on September 25, 2019 @ 9:00 A.M. in the basement of the Blair County Courthouse

CONTROL NO. OWNER SITUS MAP/PARCEL NUMBER
 OPENING BID 

AMOUNT 
 WINNING BID 

AMOUNT 
PURCHASER

NAME & ADDRESS

02055860 HIGH NELSON J & GAIL R 2101 3RD AVE 01.06-13..-101.00-000 3,085.75         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02043740 HILEMAN ADAM H 1704 3RD AVE 01.06-11..-075.00-000 2,758.42         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02200550 HUNTSMAN JEAN S 1408 17TH AVE 01.03-05..-159.00-000 2,030.23         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02191130 KELL PEARLINE W 1905 15TH AVE 01.05-09..-116.00-000 3,304.01         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04154710 KUTYBA JOSEPH A & NANCY L 109 LLOYD ST 01.10-05..-233.00-000 3,679.93         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01275490 LAMARSH PATRICK 1902 4TH ST 01.11-20..-112.00-000 3,012.84         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

03323880 LANTZ ROBERT J & KATHERINE L 626-30 N 6TH AVE 01.13-30..-059.00-000 3,989.45         3,989.45          
HAZLETT RENTALS LLC
105 N 6TH AVENUE
ALTOONA, PA 16601

02148980 LATTIERI SHAWN P & LILLIAN L 1906 8TH AVE 01.06-09..-025.00-000 1,800.90         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04066930 LEAR CATHERINE E 204-06 E CHERRY AVE 01.07-08..-048.00-000 3,014.50         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02209730 LOCKARD JAMES R & MICHELE A 1210-12 19TH AVE 01.03-06..-044.00-000 2,462.33         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02109740 LONGSTRETH J KENNETH 514 6TH AVE 01.08-01..-096.00-000 2,833.51         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04048270 MCCONNELL LAWRENCE P JR 2901 BROAD AVE 01.12-37..-072.00-000 3,770.17         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04124590 MCNARY ALVIN L 201-03 HOWARD AVE 01.07-11..-115.00-000 2,784.57         2,784.57          
THRIVE ACQUISITIONS INC
107 STIRRUP CIRCLE
DUNCANSVILLE, PA 16635

01306060 MERRITTS RONALD M & SYLVIA J 410 12TH ST 01.02-05..-002.00-000 2,131.26         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02202110 MILLER AMBER M 1005 17TH AVE 01.01-02..-196.00-000 2,616.33         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02115800 MILLER GARY P 2820 6TH AVE 01.06-04..-085.00-000 2,912.01         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02140760 MILLER KENNETH T & LEONARD CINDY S 515 7TH AVE 01.08-01..-075.00-000 2,083.01         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02087330 NACE CONNIE 1718 5TH AVE 01.06-10..-145.00-000 1,930.22         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01269130 NAPERKOSKI THOMAS R & LINDA D 1528 2ND ST 01.07-07..-112.00-000 1,523.85         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04114540 NEELY RICHARD W 814 GREEN AVE 01.01-06..-127.00-000 10,431.94       NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

03321360 O'CONNOR MARY ALICE & 1623-25 N 5TH AVE 01.13-35..-039.00-000 1,607.94         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01322920
PATTILLO IVAN ESTATE  & PATTILLO GRADY H ESTATE & HITE KATHY JOHNSON 
& WITHERSPOON SALLY MAE & PATTILLO MARY ANN & JENKIN DEBBIE & 
PATTILLO KEVIN

2138 18TH ST 01.05-03..-037.00-000 3,958.22         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04259860 POLLARD AREATHA & GRILLO LOUIS 2712 WALNUT AVE 01.12-27..-047.00-000 610.23            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04182340 POLLARD AREATHA C 2901-05 MAPLE AVE 01.12-33..-021.00-000 16,650.09       NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020
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02062580 PRATT TIMOTHY A & MICHELE K 910 4TH AVE 01.02-06..-032.00-000 2,739.58         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

03381870 RISCIGNO ESTHER J 1009 N 3RD ST 01.13-17..-024.00-000 4,070.61         4,200.00          
SENECA LEANDRO VIEW LLC
530 LYTTON AVE., 2ND FLR
PALO ALTO, CA 94301

02078150 ROBINSON SEAN F & BEICHLER RAC 2115 4TH AVE 01.06-13..-063.00-000 4,086.23         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04274740 RUPERT RYAN S & LORI J 717-19 E WALTON AVE 01.10-11..-089.00-000 5,668.19         17,000.00       

KRYSTAL DAWN DYER, DBA
PRINCESS PROPERTY MGMT
PO BOX 174
ALTOONA, PA 16603

02013470 SEVEN TWO THREE 1ST AVE LLC 723 1ST AVE 01.02-10..-001.00-000 2,798.55         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01285510 SEVEN TWO THREE 1ST AVE LLC 106-08 S 8TH ST 01.02-10..-003.00-000 429.04            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04243270 SMITH ROBERT H & GWENDOLYN M 302 SPRUCE AVE 01.07-06..-013.00-000 2,749.52         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04084090 SOLDNER RUDOLPH J & RUTH A CRAWFORD AVE 01.04-08..-028.00-000 575.92            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04094060 SOLDNER RUDOLPH J & RUTHIE 1534 CRAWFORD AVE 01.04-08..-029.00-000 4,177.68         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04068040 STEVENS PHILLIP A 328 CHERRY AVE 01.07-06..-115.00-000 3,713.02         3,713.02          
CHRISTOPHER ALAN HELSEL
150 HELSEL HTS
DUNCANSVILLE, PA 16635

01295590 STEWART THOMAS A & LYNN T 1900-02 10TH ST 01.11-19..-130.00-000 3,968.26         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01343200 STIFFLER JOAN J & TROMM ROBERT M 916 28TH ST 01.12-34..-023.00-000 2,875.01         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02186450 STOEHR THOMAS W 1905 14TH AVE 01.05-16..-017.00-000 3,124.34         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02235140 STOLTENBERG LARRY M & DONNA L 108 23RD AVE 01.11-16..-063.00-000 5,303.78         14,000.00       
ALTOONA LASER LLC
781 PARKSIDE DR
ALTOONA, PA 16601

01301080 SUTTON SHEILA 1616 11TH ST 01.01-02..-188.00-000 4,002.33         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02040620 SWEENEY WAYNE & CRYSTAL 904 3RD AVE 01.02-06..-100.00-000 3,054.67         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04173850 THOMPSON DARIN J 306 MAPLE AVE 01.11-20..-102.00-000 2,433.64         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02133200 THOMPSON MICHELLE L & REILLY MALISSA L 408 7TH AVE 01.08-02..-046.00-000 2,180.95         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

04197190 TROUTMAN VERNON F JR & ROSE M 2509 OAK AVE 01.09-03..-077.00-000 4,839.89         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02241170 TYNES JONATHAN E 1729 23RD AVE 01.05-03..-002.00-000 3,154.79         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

02011730 WALLACE WILLIAM T 323 1ST AVE 01.08-07..-024.00-000 3,066.49         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

01322680 WERTZ WILLIAM & BRENDA 2116-18 18TH ST 01.05-03..-045.00-000 5,647.25         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020
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02068370 YONKOSKY DONNA K 4044 4TH AVE 01.14-13..-076.00-000 2,266.44         2,266.44          
BENJAMIN SCHEINBERG
2820 BROAD AVENUE
ALTOONA, PA 16601

04116220 YONKOSKY TIMOTHY M 2117-19 HAMILTON ST 01.11-24..-015.00-000 688.38            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00000173 BIDDLE LEE E MILL RD 02.00-08..-037.00-000 1,532.20         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00000513 CROUTHERS MARY JOANNE 194 APPLE ST 02.00-13E.-040.00-000 6,889.23         15,000.00       
HPD FLIP 2019, LP
720 FAYETTE ST
CONSHOHOCKEN, PA 19428

00034599 FILAK LYNNE 418 HOLSTEIN DR 02.00-12..-041.00-124 902.23            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00002365 KRAPE PAUL W JR OFF SPENCER CREEK DR 02.00-12C.-002.02-000 497.15            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00039383 MARTINO CHARLES T 1006 ROSEWOOD DR 02.00-11..-104.00-118 1,854.73         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00049925 MUSSELMAN DENNIS A 430 YUKON DR 02.00-10A.-054.00-064 348.67            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00000119 SNYDER JOHN H 121 BEARD LN 02.00-13B.-026.10-000 2,317.91         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00002292 WAGNER HARRY A & ROBERT A INTERSTATE 99 02.00-12..-054.00-000 1,209.34         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00002317
WALTERS HAROLD & WALTERS FREEMAN D JR &
WALTERS JAMES ROBERT & NYDER KATHLEEN &
RITCHEY GRACE WALTERS

ASHLEY LN 02.00-10A.-013.00-000 5,734.47         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00043898 HIMES RICHARD & MARY FRANKLIN CIR 03.00-23C.-034.00-000 1,325.17         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00003655 LOWER JANNA L INTERSTATE 99 03.00-12..-097.00-000 3,268.75         3,268.75          
LANDMARK HOMES &ACQUISITIONS LLC
681 WAGNER ROAD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00003650 MILLER GARY J 625 LOWER RIGGLES GAP RD 03.00-20..-135.00-000 4,827.60         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00004008 MILLER ROBERT L 140 TIPTON MANOR RD 03.00-12B.-001.04-000 2,335.48         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00004326 PENN RAILYARD LLC KERBAUGH RD 03.00-20..-082.00-000 1,504.62         1,504.62          
26 STONESTAND LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00004328 PENN RAILYARD LLC KERBAUGH RD 03.00-20..-150.00-000 4,662.73         4,662.73          
26 STONESTAND LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

ALLEGHENY TOWNSHIP

ANTIS TOWNSHIP
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00047894 PENN RAILYARD LLC KERBAUGH DAM RD 03.00-20..-182.00-000 3,920.70         3,920.70          
26 STONESTAND LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00037072 POTTS GLENN R 275 TIPTON RD 03.00-12..-070.00-001 1,316.91         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00004568 SKIBO JOSEPH M KERBAUGH RD 03.00-20..-049.00-000 631.67            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00004827 WALENDREWISZ FRANK KERBAUGH RD 03.00-20..-054.00-000 645.67            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00043963 YON RICHARD N & BRENDA I SANDSTONE RD 03.00-12..-114.01-000 885.00            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00005605 DAUGHENBAUGH DONALD E & JANET RESERVOIR RD 04.00-04..-061.00-000 2,969.85         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00005649 GREENE HERBERT F & MARY F 489 RESERVOIR RD 04.00-08..-046.00-000 20,986.16       20,969.85       
LONGSHADOW BUILDERS LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00038638 GREENE HERBERT F JR & MEREDITH RESERVOIR RD 04.00-08..-046.01-000 10,866.96       10,866.96       
26 STONESTAND LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00006415 MERCER JAMES A 697 LOOP RD 04.00-02D.-021.00-000 11,201.81       60,000.00       
HPD FLIP 2019, LP
720 FAYETTE ST
CONSHOHOCKEN, PA 19428

00006418 MERCER JAMES A LOOP RD 04.00-02D.-026.00-000 1,321.71         1,346.71          
HPD FLIP 2019, LP
720 FAYETTE ST
CONSHOHOCKEN, PA 19428

00006340 STOEHER JOYCE SNOWBERGER ET AL SNOWBERGER LN 04.00-02..-047.00-000 17,996.70       40,000.00       
SENECA LEANDRO VIEW LLC
530 LYTTON AVE., 2ND FLR
PALO ALTO, CA 94301

00007397 KRAPE PAUL W JR 2ND ALY 05.00-03..-021.00-000 472.88            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00006929 MATTHEWS DEBORAH S & ROBERT C 621 LOWTHER ST 05.00-04..-143.00-000 8,564.97         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00008109 WILT PAUL S 125 VINEYARD LN 07.00-02..-187.00-000 6,248.55         6,248.55          
JEROME M & KIMBERLY M ECKARDT
125 VINEYARD LANE
DUNCANSVILLE, PA 16635

00044440 CONWAY DAVID L & ROSANNA K GOBBLERS KNOB RD 08.00-21..-046.19-000 691.56            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

BLAIR TOWNSHIP

BELLWOOD BOROUGH

DUNCANSVILLE BOROUGH

FRANKSTOWN TOWNSHIP
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00009506
DAVIS PATRICIA A & MERRITTS NANCY LOUISE &
CIOFFI SARAH KATHERINE

SWINGING BRIDGE RD 08.00-16..-023.04-000 971.43            971.43             

DIANE SNAVELY COX & CANOE ISLAND-
CATOCTIN FARM LLC
634 SWINGING BRIDGE RDAD
HOLLIDAYSBURG, PA 16648

00009822
MOYER DEBORAH & WALLS ROBIN &
FETZER JACK JR & FETZER DANIEL

AQUA LN 08.00-15B.-040.00-000 639.93            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00009823
MOYER DEBORAH & WALLS ROBIN &
FETZER JACK JR & FETZER DANIEL

267 AQUA LN 08.00-15B.-041.00-000 3,548.35         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00010007 WEIR DANNY L SR RT 22 08.00-14..-013.00-000 795.40            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00050703 BOUGHER JAMES C 230 MCDONALD RD 09.00-04..-048.01-002 474.34            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00050127 DAVIS RAE 169 CHEVROLET DR 09.00-06..-008.13-015 2,013.07         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00041031 EMERICK ADDAM 109 FLEETWOOD CT 09.00-07..-051.07-072 1,088.48         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00052203 KRANIK VICKEY LYNNE 148 REDMEN CT 09.00-07..-051.07-027 967.94            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00035300 MCCARTY CRAIG A & GLEICHERT NANCY J EVERETT RD 09.00-07E.-094.00-000 2,814.51         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00046168 ROBERTS WENDY 312 MCDOWELL RD 09.00-07G.-072.00-002 712.49            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00052783 STRAYER PAIGE 153 CHEVROLET DR 09.00-06..-008.13-010 636.82            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00011651 AMMON MARILYN P FAMILY TRUST SUGAR MAPLE LN 10.00-07AB-065.00-000 589.43            589.43             
ASSET LIQUIDATION GROUP OF PA LLC
100 BEL-AIR CIRCLE
HOLLIDAYSBURG, PA 16648

00012106 D'AMBROSIO JAMES J & NANCY H RIDGE RUN 10.00-07AE-148.00-000 1,378.19         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00012525 FREEMAN DONALD R & NANCY J BEDFORD ST 10.00-15..-075.26-000 1,058.48         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00012116 KRAPE PAUL W JR BEDFORD ST 10.00-15..-103.00-000 764.98            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00012425 KRAPE PAUL W JR POPLAR RUN RD 10.00-07AF-239.00-000 917.65            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00012645 KRAPE PAUL W JR RIDGE RUN 10.00-07AG-014.00-000 658.94            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00013202 KRAPE PAUL W JR KITTANNING RUN 10.00-07AE-050.00-000 892.65            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00013925 KRAPE PAUL W JR RIDGE RUN 10.00-07AG-133.00-000 658.94            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00033007 KRAPE PAUL W JR IRONMASTERS 10.00-07AG-048.00-000 658.94            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

FREEDOM TOWNSHIP

GREENFIELD TOWNSHIP
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00012047 LEEDY THOMAS R & KAREN J 504 CHURCHVIEW CIR 10.00-15..-070.07-000 4,370.00         25,000.00       
HPD FLIP 2019, LP
720 FAYETTE ST
CONSHOHOCKEN, PA 19428

00013316 MUSSELMAN SHELBY BUCK LN 10.00-10..-044.00-000 1,358.97         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00013382 PALICKA JOY POPLAR RUN RD 10.00-07AE-100.00-000 604.93            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00013383 PALICKA JOY POPLAR RUN RD 10.00-07AE-101.00-000 604.93            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00013644 SLIDER MARK ALAN POPLAR RUN RD 10.00-07AE-077.00-000 646.94            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00014897 SNYDER FAMILY TRUST N JUNIATA ST 11.01-04..-025.00-000 1,412.52         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00014343 WATT MAXMILLIAN & DONNA WHITE ST 11.01-09..-022.00-000 1,412.52         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00016287 DEBARTOLOME JAMES F 3278 PINEY CREEK RD 12.00-01A.-025.00-000 7,436.30         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00016584 WAGNER GLADYS 195 MOUNTAIN LN 12.00-08..-013.00-000 40,391.51       58,000.00       
LONGSHADOW BUILDERS LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00016283 WAGNER GLADYS S ALLISON DR 12.00-08..-035.00-000 2,041.15         8,000.00          
LONGSHADOW BUILDERS LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00016864 LONGENECKER JOHN K & IRENE R LILLY RD 13.00-07..-004.00-000 5,496.55         15,000.00       
LONGSHADOW BUILDERS LLC
681 WAGNER RD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00016905 NEFF RONALD E & JANICE M HILLTOP DR 13.00-08..-021.01-000 845.20            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00042542 SNYDER JOHN 1245 FOOT OF TEN RD 13.00-12..-053.00-001 588.87            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00017924 CHESNEY CATHERINE C N 14TH AVE 14.00-18D.-031.00-000 1,067.02         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00035770 CODY KAREN M SHERWOOD RD 14.00-23..-021.07-000 1,826.76         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00019016 DELL RICHARD W 105 FOXGLOVE RD 14.00-23A.-101.00-000 8,499.09         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00018162 DIEHL JEFFERY A 2823 JEFFERSON ST 14.00-12E.-166.00-000 3,330.37         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00018792 GABLE WILLIAM F EST JUNIATA GAP RD 14.00-08..-015.00-000 799.21            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

LOGAN TOWNSHIP

HOLLIDAYSBURG BOROUGH

HUSTON TOWNSHIP

JUNIATA TOWNSHIP
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Sale was held on September 25, 2019 @ 9:00 A.M. in the basement of the Blair County Courthouse
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00019029 GUYER CHARLES H & YOUNG JANE E REAR COLGATE LN 14.00-23..-052.02-000 1,686.06         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00019162 HAYES DANIEL E  ET AL ARBOR AVE 14.00-08B.-022.00-000 861.21            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00019163 HAYES DANIEL E  ET AL ARBOR AVE 14.00-08B.-021.00-000 936.41            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00043642 MEISNER MARVIN H & JUDITH S & HARKLESS RONALD I & MARY C FERNWAY DR 14.00-16C.-100.00-000 1,264.53         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00020843 PATTERSON ELDIN C & PATTERSON ELDIN C II 493 WEAVER ST 14.00-11B1-007.00-000 14,992.79       NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00022550 PERSUN GERALD L & CAROLYN L SPRANKLE AVE 14.00-15AD-004.00-000 897.61            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00020951 PIPER E MARIE 172 LOOKOUT AVE 14.00-08A.-040.00-000 3,049.96         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00022787 RESIG J P WOPSY RD 14.00-08..-003.00-000 933.66            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00038685 SCHERDEN THOMAS 101 ILLINOIS DR 14.00-22..-002.00-003 479.90            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00021945 THOMAS H R BAKERS LN 14.00-12..-092.00-000 2,848.42         2,848.42          
DWAIN J & KIMBERLY E FREET
589 BECKERS LANE
ALTOONA, PA 16601

00039790 MARTIN KAREN L 313 SMITH TRL 15.00-03..-041.00-072 737.98            737.98             
W GENE HENRY
111 JULIAN STREET
MARTINSBURG, PA 16662

00022822 SHEFFY RALPH R 107 S ANN ST 15.00-03..-033.00-000 6,600.08         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00023036 SHEFFY RALPH R W ALLEGHENY ST 15.00-03..-032.00-000 1,409.59         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00042285 CLARK MELISSA 464 BRUMBAUGH LN 17.00-04..-011.00-111 1,302.34         1,302.34          
W GENE HENRY
111 JULIAN STREET
MARTINSBURG, PA 16662

00024636 SMITH SUSAN K 321 POPLAR ST 18.00-01..-162.00-000 4,868.25         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00025070 WEBB HARVEY B 261 N MAIN ST 18.00-01..-060.00-000 2,376.56         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00025713 BOYER GALEN C & JENNIE M HANCOCK ST 19.00-13A.-016.00-000 474.76            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00026041 DIDOMENICO MARK 261 LITTLE BEAR RUN 19.00-27..-002.01-000 780.57            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

MARTINSBURG BOROUGH

NORTH WOODBURY TOWNSHIP

ROARING SPRING BOROUGH

SNYDER TOWNSHIP
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00036081 FINK MICHAEL L 2214 GLAD AVE 19.00-18..-025.08-000 7,316.31         9,000.00          
SENECA LEANDRO VIEW LLC
530 LYTTON AVE., 2ND FLR
PALO ALTO, CA 94301

00025889 FINK MICHAEL L REV 2109 GLAD AVE 19.00-18B.-003.05-000 3,978.69         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00043546 GUMMO TABITHA JO 117 GLADYS LN 19.00-09..-051.00-045 900.78            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00026106 HERZOG MARTIN CARIBOU LN 19.00-19..-010.00-000 4,338.38         12,025.00       
PATRICE & MICHAEL DELBAGGIO
578 CARIBOU LANE
TYRONE, PA 16686

00034242 BORDER WILLIAM 628 PLUM CREEK RD 20.00-05..-023.00-000 8,994.98         8,994.98          
LITTLE BLUE LLC
434 PHOENIX DRIVE
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

00027523 CONARD MICHAEL 212 GIRARD ST 20.00-04..-021.00-000 9,893.78         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00027940 JEREMIAH PECK CEMETERY                   *(ONLY .069 ACRES) FREDERICK RD 20.00-09..-015.01-000 1,247.82         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00047660 MOORE LISA K COOLIDGE AVE 20.00-04..-017.06-000 1,578.66         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00028461 PAUL FRANK W EST IRISH FLATS LN 21.00-02..-005.00-000 3,470.35         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00029643 HILDEBRAND DAVID 120 CREEKSIDE DR 22.07-12..-001.00-022 472.34            472.34             
COMMUNITY HOMES LLC
158 CAMBRIDGE DRIVE
DUNCANSVILLE, PA 16635

00029562 MILLER GARY J 306 W 6TH ST 22.01-06..-024.00-000 3,935.39         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00030957 SEYMOUR ROBERT J 1859 ADAMS AVE 22.07-02..-025.00-000 3,764.60         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00028747 WILSON JODI R 105 CREEKSIDE DR 22.07-12..-001.00-001 526.34            NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00031795 MCCARTY RANDEL OFF DEMPSEY LN 24.00-12..-003.05-000 1,775.28         1,775.28          
JAMES R SNOWBERGER
267 DIVELY ROAD
WILLIAMBURG, PA 16693

00031681 PENN QUARRY LLC COVEDALE RD 24.00-06..-001.00-000 14,615.90       14,615.90       
HOSS LAND CO 
681 WAGNER ROAD
CHAMBERSBURG, PA 17202

TUNNELHILL BOROUGH

TAYLOR TOWNSHIP

TYRONE TOWNSHIP

TYRONE BOROUGH

WOODBURY TOWNSHIP
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00000123 KALWASINSKI EUGENE A & RUTH A 806 TUNNELHILL ST 25.00-02B.-008.00-000 7,716.79         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020

00002286 MCINTOSH JAMES A 980 TUNNELHILL ST 25.00-02A.-007.00-000 9,116.83         NO BID GOING TO JUDICIAL SALE IN JUNE 2020
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